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Introducing EarthPly, a revolutionary sustainable
work surface that combines the best of
eco-conscious materials and functional design.

THE EARTHPLY COLLECTION

https://www.mantraif.com/


We give a sheet.

Attainable
Sustainable

The EarthPly Collection, comprising of a variety
of table top sizes and legs, offers options to
adapt to conference and meeting rooms’ needs.
The core value of this collection resides in its
sustainability story of its materiality. The FSC
plywood sandwiched between two recycled
paper composite layers makes for a top that is
not only good looking in most any aesthetic, but
is also an authentic sustainable choice of
renewable ingredients. As with all products in
Mantra Inspired Furniture, this collection is built
with longevity in mind. 

100% POST-CONSUMER RECYCLED PAPER
+

FINNISH BIRCH PLYWOOD

THE EARTHPLY COLLECTION

www.mantraif.com

https://www.mantraif.com/


Rise up.

ELECTRIC 3-STAGE BASE SMART CONTROLS

Promote healthy workspaces by getting workers
moving with height adjustable tables. Intuitively
designed, our height adjustable tables get you
from sitting to standing with a natural lift of the
controller paddle.

LED display controls with Bluetooth® wireless
technology as well as memory and reminder
functions. Control the height adjustability of your
table straight from your smartphone.

Adjustable Tables
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Slant Leg
Solid Maple

Blade Leg
Forged Steel

Square Hairpin Leg
Forged Steel

Square Post Leg
Forged Steel

THE EARTHPLY COLLECTION

Table Top
42" x 84"

LIST PRICE :
$4,355

Table Top

48" x 96"

LIST PRICE :
$6,126

Table Top
48" x 108"

LIST PRICE :
$6,466

Height-Adjustable Frame
Electric + Kick-and-Click Assembly

Height-Adjustable Frame
Electric + Kick-and-Click Assembly

Height-Adjustable Worksurface

23" x 47"
LIST PRICE :

$1,366

Height-Adjustable Worksurface

29" x 59"

LIST PRICE :
$1,533
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